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IN THE UNITED STATES COURT OF APPEALS  
FOR VETERANS CLAIMS 

TAMMY SCANLAN,  ) 
) 

Appellant, ) 
) 

v. ) Vet. App. 21-2827 
) 

DENIS MCDONOUGH, ) 
in his capacity as  ) 
Secretary of Veterans Affairs, ) 

) 
Appellee. ) 

APPELLANT’S APPLICATION FOR AWARD OF  
REASONABLE ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND EXPENSES 

PURSUANT TO THE EQUAL ACCESS TO JUSTICE ACT 

The Appellant, Tammy Scanlan (“Ms. Scanlan”), respectfully applies pursuant to the 

Equal Access to Justice Act (“EAJA”), 28 U.S.C. § 2412(d), for an award of reasonable 

attorneys’ fees and expenses in the amount of $11,549.57.  

Ms. Scanlan will begin with the pertinent facts. She then will address why she meets 

the requirements for the award of EAJA fees and expenses that he requests. In particular, she 

is a prevailing party within Congress’ intent for the EAJA. She satisfies the EAJA’s eligibility 

requirements to receive an EAJA award. The Secretary’s position in the administrative and 

court proceedings was not substantially justified. The attorneys’ fees and expenses for which 

Ms. Scanlan seeks an EAJA award are reasonable. She requests that the Application be granted. 

STATEMENT OF FACTS 

On March 3, 2021, the Board of Veterans’ Appeals (“Board”) issued a decision in which 

it denied entitlement to additional accrued benefits in the amount of $1,380.00 for 

reimbursement of the expense of the last sickness and burial of Ms. Scanlan’s late further, U.S. 
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military veteran Michael Scanlan. On April 21, 2021, Ms. Scanlan timely filed a Notice of 

Appeal with this Court. At the time, she was proceeding pro se. 

Ms. Scanlan elected to participate in the Court’s Rule 33 Pilot Program being facilitated 

tbt ye Veterans Consortium Pro Bono Program (“TVC”).  TVC contacted me regarding the 

possibility of representing Ms. Scanlan pro bono in her briefing conference proceedings, and 

I agreed. I entered a limited appearance on September 3, 2021, and on the same date the Court 

issued an Order to file Ms. Scanlan’s brief within sixty days. This Order was prelude to, on 

September 9, 2021, the Court issuing an Order scheduling the appeal’s telephonic briefing 

conference. The Court rescheduled the briefing conference to October 28, 2021; and, pursuant 

to the Court’s Orders, Ms. Scanlan through counsel prepared a Rule 33 Summary of the Issues 

addressing the errors committed by the Board in the decision on appeal. Ms. Scanlan, through 

counsel, served the Summary of Issues on counsel for the Secretary and the Court’s Central 

Legal Staff on October 14, 2021. 

On October 28, 2021, the Rule 33 staff conference proceeded as scheduled. The parties 

were unable at that time to reach an agreement in principle as to an amicable resolution of the 

appeal. With my limited appearance under the Rule 33 Pilot Program coming to a close, I 

agreed to represent Ms. Scanlan throughout the remainder of the appeal. On November 4, 

2021, I filed a “full” notice of appearance as lead counsel and a copy of our retainer agreement. 

On January 13, 2022, Ms. Scanlan through counsel filed her initial brief in this appeal. 

In that 30-page brief, which addressed multiple issues of statutory interpretation that would 

warrant a three-judge panel’s review, Ms. Scanlan set forth several reasons why the Board 

prejudicially erred in denying additional reimbursement. The Secretary once again elected to 
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defend the appeal, filing a U.S. Vet. App. Rule 28(b) brief on April 28, 2022. On June 27, 2022, 

Ms. Scanlan through counsel filed her reply brief. 

On July 7, 2022, the Secretary filed this appeal’s Record of Proceedings, which 

Ms. Scanlan through counsel reviewed the same day for legibility and completeness. On 

December 22, 2022, the Court submitted the appeal to a three-judge panel. 

On January 9, 2023, my colleague Katy S. Clemens entered an appearance as co-

counsel. We intended for her to handle this appeal’s oral argument for Ms. Scanlan, should 

the Court order it. The Court issued an Order on January 10, 2023, that it would schedule oral 

argument as the business of the Court permits. After the Court scheduled oral argument, the 

Secretary designated new lead counsel. The parties then re-engaged discussions for an amicable 

resolution of the appeal. On March 29, 2023, the parties filed a joint motion for partial remand 

(“JMPR”). 

In the JMPR, the parties agreed that the part of the Board’s decision that granted 

entitlement to additional accrued benefits in the amount of $1,380.00, was a favorable finding 

that this Court could not disturb. The parties further agreed that the Board prejudicially erred 

in denying additional accrued benefits beyond that amount. Ms. Scanlan had previously been 

before this Court, and that appeal had resulted in a joint motion for partial remand in which 

the parties there agreed that remand was warranted because the Board decision there on appeal 

had “failed to review the entirety of the expenses itemized in Appellant’s September 2016 VA 

Form 21-534EZ.” In this appeal, which Ms. Scanlan took from the decision that the Board 

issued on remand from that prior appeal, the parties agreed that the Board “erred by failing to 

substantially comply with the terms of the Court’s prior remand order as required by Stegall v. 
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West, 11 Vet.App. 268 (1998).” JMPR at 2. The Board “acknowledged the contention on 

Appellant’s VA Form 21-534EZ that reimbursement of additional accrued benefits was 

warranted because she provided 24-hour care to the Veteran, including helping him with 

activities of daily living such as bathing and showering, shaving, feeding, and providing 

transportation to doctor’s appointments for a little over 2 years.” JMPR at 2–3. The Board 

erred, they agreed, by finding conclusorily and without sufficiently addressing Ms. Scanlan’s 

primary assertion, that she supposedly “failed to identify, itemize, or provide evidence of any 

specific expenditures born[e] by her in the course of her care for the Veteran.” JMPR at 3. 

“The Board did not adequately address whether those caregiving services are reimbursable 

expenses incident to the Veteran’s last sickness, as required by the September 2020 JMPR.” 

JMPR at 3. “In this regard, the parties” agreed to note, “pursuant to Helmick v. McDonough, 34 

Vet.App. 141, 143 (2021), the phrase ‘bore the expense’ of las sickness in 38 U.S.C. § 5121(a)(6) 

and 38 C.F.R. § 3.1000(a)(5) means something broader than ‘paid.’” JMPR at 3. The parties 

also agreed to recite the Board’s obligation to address on remand “the arguments presented in 

Appellant’s Initial Brief and Reply Brief that were filed in this appeal,” JMPR at 4, and to 

associate a copy of those briefs with the record. JMPR at 6. 

On April 10, 2023, the Court granted the JMPR. It ordered the matter remanded for 

action consistent with the terms of the JMPR. The Order also was the mandate of the Court, 

and it instructed that any application pursuant to the EAJA for an award of attorney fees and 

other expenses be submitted for filing within the next 30 days. Ms. Scanlan now files this 

Application within that 30-day period. 
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ARGUMENT 

“The EAJA is a fee-shifting statute that allows a party who prevails in a civil action 

brought … against the government to recover attorney’s fees and costs.” Davis v. Nicholson, 

475 F.3d 1360, 1363 (Fed. Cir. 2007). Through it, Congress has instructed that: 

a court shall award to a prevailing party … fees and other expenses … incurred 
by that party in any … proceedings for judicial review of agency action, 
brought … against the United States in any court having jurisdiction of that 
action, unless the court finds that the position of the United States was 
substantially justified or that special circumstances make an award unjust. 

28 U.S.C. § 2412(d)(1)(A).  

As controlling precedent holds, “[t]he essential objective of the EAJA [is] to ensure 

that persons will not be deterred from seeking review of, or defending against, unjustified 

governmental action because of the expense involved in the vindication of their rights … .” 

Kelly v. Nicholson, 463 F.3d 1349, 1353 (Fed. Cir. 2006) (quoting Johnson v. Gonzales, 416 F.3d 

205, 208 (3d Cir. 2005) (alteration and omission in Kelly)); accord Ravin v. Wilkie, 31 Vet. App. 

104, 107 (2019) (en banc) (“EAJA’s purpose is to ensure that those trying to vindicate their 

rights against wrongful government action can obtain adequate representation.”). “Removing 

such deterrents is imperative in the veterans benefits context, which is intended to be uniquely 

pro-claimant … .” Kelly, 463 F.3d at 1353 (citing Hodge v. West, 155 F.3d 1356, 1362–63 (Fed. 

Cir. 1998) and Collaro v. West, 136 F.3d 1304, 1309–10 (Fed. Cir. 1998)). Indeed, as the Federal 

Circuit has underscored, “EAJA is a vital complement to this system designed to aid veterans, 

because it helps to ensure that they will seek an appeal when the VA has failed in its duty to 

aid them or has otherwise erroneously denied them the benefits that they have earned.” Id.
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It is against this backdrop that Ms. Scanlan respectfully submits that she satisfies all of 

the EAJA’s requirements for the Court to grant the award of EAJA fees and expenses that 

she seeks in this case.

I. Ms. Scanlan Is a Prevailing Party Within Congress’ Intent for the EAJA. 

“A party seeking EAJA fees must submit a timely application that includes… a showing 

that the applicant is a prevailing party … .” Blue v. Wilkie, 30 Vet. App. 61, 65 (2018). To obtain 

“prevailing party” status, an appellant need only to have obtained success “on any significant 

issue in litigation which achieved some of the benefit … sought in bringing the suit.” Shalala 

v. Schaefer, 509 U.S. 292, 302 (1993) (quoting Texas State Teachers Ass’n v. Garland Indep. Sch. Dist., 

489 U.S. 782, 791–92 (1989)). 

Here, the Court vacated the Board’s denial on the basis of the Secretary’s concession 

that the Board erred, failing to satisfy its well-established Stegall duties. The Court order 

vacating the Board’s denial, and remanding, thus plainly was predicated on administrative error 

and creates the “material alteration of the legal relationship of the parties” necessary to permit 

an award of attorney’s fees. See, e.g., Zuberi v. Nicholson, 19 Vet. App. 541, 544 (2006) (collecting 

additional authorities). Ms. Scanlan is a prevailing party. 

II. Ms. Scanlan Satisfies the EAJA’s Eligibility Requirements for an EAJA Award. 

As an officer of the Court, the undersigned counsel hereby states that Ms. Scanlan’s 

net worth did not exceed $2,000,000 at the time this civil action was filed, nor did Ms. Scanlan 

own any unincorporated business, partnership, corporation, association, unit of local 

government, or organization, of which the net worth exceeded $7,000,000 and which had 

more than 500 employees. See Bazalo v. Brown, 9 Vet. App. 304, 309, 311 (1996). In addition, 
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Ms. Scanlan submitted a Declaration of Financial Hardship, which was accepted for filing by 

the Court. See Owens v. Brown, 10 Vet. App. 65, 67 (1997). Ms. Scanlan thus is a party eligible 

to receive an award of reasonable fees and expenses. See 28 U.S.C. § 2412(d)(2)(B). 

III. The Secretary’s Position Was Not Substantially Justified. 

The Secretary can defeat this Application only by demonstrating that the government’s 

position was substantially justified. See Brewer v. Am. Battle Monument Comm’n, 814 F.2d 1564, 

1566–67 (Fed. Cir. 1987); Stillwell v. Brown, 6 Vet. App. 291, 301 (1994). The Supreme Court 

has held that for the position of the government to be substantially justified, it must have a 

“reasonable basis both in law and fact.” Pierce v. Underwood, 487 U.S. 552, 565 (1988); accord Beta 

Sys. v. United States, 866 F.2d 1404, 1406 (Fed. Cir. 1989).  

In this case, the Secretary’s administrative position and litigation position through the 

appeal’s briefing was not substantially justified. As described more fully in the Statement of 

Facts above, the Court vacated the Board denial on appeal and remanded based on the Board’s 

errors, which the Secretary conceded, in failing to satisfy its Stegall duties. The prejudicial Board 

error had no reasonable basis in fact or law. 
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IV. The Attorneys’ Fees and Expenses for Which Ms. Scanlan Seeks an EAJA 
Award Are Reasonable. 

An itemized statement of the services rendered and the reasonable fees and expenses 

for which Ms. Scanlan seeks compensation is attached to this application as Exhibit A. 

Included with Exhibit A is a certification that lead counsel has “(1) reviewed the combined 

billing statement and is satisfied that it accurately reflects the work performed by all counsel 

and (2) considered and eliminated all time that is excessive or redundant.” Baldridge v. Nicholson, 

19 Vet. App. 227, 240 (2005).1

1 A rate in excess of $125 per hour for Ms. Scanlan’s counsel in this case is justified based 
on the increase in the cost of living since the EAJA was amended in March 1996. See 28 U.S.C. 
§ 2412(d)(2)(A)(ii). For attorney John D. Niles, the $125 attorney fee rate, adjusted for inflation 
for the Washington Metropolitan Area from which Mr. Niles and Ms. Clemens provided all 
of their legal services for this appeal, was $226.23 in January 2022, the month in which the 
Initial Brief was filed and the approximate midpoint of this appeal. See Bureau of Labor 
Statistics Data, CPI-U, Washington-Arlington-Alexandria, DC-VA-MD-WV Area (Exhibit B). 
This rate was calculated by using the CPI-U for the Washington-Arlington-Alexandria, DC-
VA-MD-WV area adjusted for inflation between March 1996 (158.4) and January 2022 
(286.678). Exhibit B; Mannino v. West, 12 Vet. App. 242 (1999).  

The market rates for Ms. Scanlan’s counsel exceeded the requested rates per hour 
during the relevant time period. See Covington v. District of Columbia, 839 F. Supp. 894, 904–05 
(D.D.C. 1993), aff’d, 58 F.3d 1101 (D.C. Cir. 1995); USAO Attorney’s Fees Matrix, 2015-2021 
(Exhibit C) (“The methodology used to compute the rates in this matrix replaces that used 
prior to 2015, which started with the matrix of hourly rates developed in Laffey v. Nw. Airlines, 
Inc., 572 F. Supp. 354 (D.D.C. 1983), aff’d in part, rev’d in part on other grounds, 746 F.2d 4 (D.C. 
Cir. 1984), cert. denied, 472 U.S. 1021 (1985), and then adjusted those rates based on the 
Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers (CPI-U) for the Washington-Baltimore ... 
area.”); see also Sandoval v. Brown, 9 Vet. App. 177, 181 (1996); Richlin Sec. Serv. Co. v. Chertoff, 553 
U.S. 571 (2008). The prevailing market rate for the work done by paralegals in the Washington-
Arlington-Alexandria, DC-VA-MD-WV area was at least $180.00 from June 1, 2020, to the 
present. See Ex. C. The CPI-U for the Washington-Arlington-Alexandria, DC-VA-MD-WV 
area, in January 2022 was 286.678 See Ex. B. The CPI-U for the South Region, encompassing 
Mrs. Hiers’s location in the Gulfport, MS, area, in the same month, January 2022, was 271.634. 
See Exhibit D. The product of $180.00 and the ratio of 271.634 to 286.678 equals $170.55. 
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FEES 

Name Rate Hours Fee Amount 

John D. Niles  $226.23     49.5    $11,198.39 
(2008 law graduate) 

Katy S. Clemens $226.23      1.1         $248.85 
(2006 law graduate) 

Karen Hiers  $170.55      0.6        $102.33 
(paralegal) 

TOTAL     $11,549.57 

EXPENSES 

Ms. Scanlan does not claim reimbursement under the EAJA for any expenses incurred 

in connection with this appeal.  

CONCLUSION

Wherefore, Ms. Scanlan respectfully requests that the Court award attorneys’ fees in 

the total amount of $11,549.57.

Counsel for Appellant

May 8, 2023 Respectfully submitted, 

/s/ John D. Niles 
John D. Niles 
Carpenter Chartered 
P.O. Box 2099 
Topeka, KS 66601 
785-357-5251 
john@carpenterchartered.com 
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Staff Hours for Tammy Scanlan 
Vet. App. No. 21-2827 

A-1 

Date Time Summary 
09/03/2021 1.6 Staff: John Niles 

Correspond with The Veterans Consortium regarding Rule 33 Pilot 
Project placement (0.2); analyze Board of Veterans’ Appeals 
(“Board”) decision and draft summary of issues to raise on appeal 
(1.0); correspond with Ms. Scanlan regarding same (0.3). File limited 
Notice of Appearance (0.1). 

09/03/2021 0.3 Staff: Karen Hiers 
Prepare file for appeal and prepare Record Before the Agency 
(“RBA”) for Mr. Niles’s reivew (0.3). 

09/09/2021 0.1 Staff: John Niles 
Analyze Order setting Rule 33 briefing conference for time during 
which I possess an existing, unavoidable conflict (oral argument in 
another court), and email Central Legal Staff and Office of General 
Counsel (“OGC”) attorney regarding rescheduling of conference. 

09/10/2021 0.2 Staff: John Niles 
Prepare motion to reschedule briefing conference (0.2). 

10/11/2021 2.5 Staff: John Niles 
Analyze pages 1,114 through 1,448 of 1,448-page Record Before 
the Agency (“RBA”) for facts and issues pertinent to Rule 33 
Summary of the Issues (“SOI”) (2.5). 

10/12/2021 3.0 Staff: John Niles 
Analyze pages 1 through 1,113 of RBA for facts and issues 
pertinent to SOI (3.0). 

10/14/2021 2.8 Staff: John Niles 
Draft Rule 33 Summary of the Issues (“SOI”) (2.2). Prepare RBA 
excerpts to accompany SOI (0.2). Email VA’s counsel and Central 
Legal Staff regarding SOI (0.1). Draft certificate of service (0.1). 
Correspond with client regarding settlement authority (0.2). 

10/28/2021 0.7 Staff: John Niles 
Prepare to and participate in Rule 33 conference (0.3). Follow up 
with Ms. Scanlan regarding Rule 33 conference outcome, offer of 
representation for the remainder of the appeal, and next steps (0.4). 

10/28/2021 0.3 Staff: Karen Hiers 
Prepare and mail to Ms. Scanlan a retainer agreement, and prepare 
full Notice of Appearance for Mr. Niles (0.3). 

11/04/2021 0.1 Staff: John Niles 
Finalize and file retainer agreement and Notice of Appearance (0.1). 

11/24/2021 0.0 Staff: John Niles 
Correspond with OGC regarding and prepare motion for extension 
to file Initial Brief [0.3 hours eliminated in billing judgment]. 



Staff Hours for Tammy Scanlan 
Vet. App. No. 21-2827 

A-2 

Date Time Summary 
01/10/2022 7.6 Staff: John Niles 

Begin to draft Initial Brief: 

• Statement of the Issues (0.8) 

• Statement of the Case (0.8) 

• Statement of Facts (through Mr. Scanlan’s passing) (3.0) 

• Statement of Facts (through Board decision on appeal) (3.0) 
01/11/2022 3.8 Staff: John Niles 

Continue to draft Initial Brief: 

• Argument, Part I, updating similar material from prior 
briefing (1.0) 

• Argument, Part II, statutory and regulatory issues likely 
warranting panel review, Board error (1.5); error’s prejudice 
(1.3) 

01/12/2022 6.6 Staff: John Niles 
Continue to draft Initial Brief: 

• Argument, Part III, Board error (1.2); error’s prejudice, to 
point regarding 38 U.S.C. § 5121A(b) (3.0); error’s prejudice, 
from § 5121A(b) to end (1.5). 

• Conclusion (0.1) 

• Summary of the Argument (0.8) 
01/13/2022 3.2 Staff: John Niles 

Draft inserts to increase brief’s persuasive value (1.7). Draft Table 
of Authorities and finalize brief, including Table of Contents (1.5). 

05/11/2022 0.0 Staff: John Niles 
Correspond with OGC regarding and prepare motion for extension 
to file Reply Brief [0.2 hours eliminated in billing judgment]. 

06/26/2022 8.0 Staff: John Niles 
Analyze Secretary’s Brief and outline Reply Brief (1.5). Draft Reply 
Brief: 

• Preliminary Statement (0.5).  

• Argument, Part I, through dictionary definitions, to include 
researching the Secretary’s cited dictionary (3.0) [additional 
0.5 hours eliminated in billing judgment].  

• Argument, Part I, from there to end (3.0) [additional 1.0 
hours eliminated in billing judgment]. 

06/27/2022 4.5 Staff: John Niles 
Continue to draft Reply Brief: 

• Argument, Part II (3.0). 

• Conclusion (0.1). 

• Table of Authorities (0.7). 
Draft inserts (0.5) and finalize and file brief (0.2). 



Staff Hours for Tammy Scanlan 
Vet. App. No. 21-2827 

A-3 

Date Time Summary 
07/07/2023 0.4 Staff: John Niles 

Analyze Record of Proceedings and determine that no dispute is 
necessary (0.4). 

01/03/2023 0.1 Staff: John Niles 
Correspond with Ms. Scanlan regarding panel order, likely oral 
argument, and Katy S. Clemens joining the representation. Confer 
with Ms. Clemens regarding appeal (0.1). 

01/03/2023 0.1 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Correspond with Mr. Niles regarding Scanlan appeal and upcoming 
oral argument (0.1). 

01/09/2023 0.2 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Begin to review case; prepare Notice of Appearance (0.2). 

01/27/2023 0.1 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Teleconference with Ms. Scanlan regarding case status (0.1). 

02/01/2023 0.0 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Draft email to Ms. Scanlan regarding questions concerning case 
[0.1 hours eliminated in billing judgment]. 

02/28/2023 0.6 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Teleconference with Mr. Niles regarding oral argument preparation 
and rough outline (0.6). 

02/28/2023 0.3 Staff: John Niles 
Prepare for teleconference with Ms. Clemens regarding oral 
argument preparation, including to compile rough outline (0.3); 
teleconference with Ms. Clemens regarding same [0.6 hours 
eliminated in billing judgment]. 

03/02/2023 0.1 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Email Mr. Niles regarding research projects for oral argument (0.1).

03/23/2023 0.2 Staff: John Niles 
Analyze and respond to email from new OGC attorney regarding 
meeting to discuss case, interpret same as overture regarding 
possible incoming JMPR, follow up to request pause of all work 
pending further word (0.2). 

03/23/2023 0.0 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Correspond with Mr. Niles regarding possible incoming JMPR 
offer [0.1 hours eliminated in billing judgment]. 

03/24/2023 1.1 Staff: John Niles 
Prepare to and participate in teleconference with OGC attorney 
regarding exploration of JMPR (0.7); follow up with client and 
Ms. Clemens regarding same (0.4). 

03/24/2023 0.0 Staff: Katy S. Clemens 
Review draft JMPR [0.3 hours eliminated in billing judgment]. 



Staff Hours for Tammy Scanlan 
Vet. App. No. 21-2827 

A-4 

Date Time Summary 
03/25/2023 0.5 Staff: John Niles 

Analyze draft JMPR and propose revisions to same (0.5) 
03/28/2023 0.1 Staff: John Niles 

Re-review draft JMPR [0.2 hours eliminated in billing 
judgment]; correspond with OGC regarding same (0.1). 

03/29/2023 0.2 Staff: John Niles 
Review revised draft JMPR and correspond with OGC regarding 
review and acceptance of revisions; finalize JMPR (0.2). 

05/08/2023 1.9 Staff: John Niles 
Draft Equal Access to Justice Act application, including 
attachments and to eliminate hours in the exercise of billing 
judgment (1.9). 

CERTIFICATION 

As lead counsel for Ms. Scanlan in this Court action, I have reviewed the combined 

billing statement attached as Exhibit A. I am satisfied that it accurately reflects the work 

performed by all counsel and staff and that I have considered and eliminated all time that is 

excessive or redundant. 

Counsel for Appellant

May 8, 2023 Respectfully submitted, 

/s/ John D. Niles.
John D. Niles 
Carpenter Chartered 
P.O. Box 2099 
Topeka, KS 66601 
785-357-5251 
john@carpenterchartered.com 
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