

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Billed To
Gary Ferko
19663 Teddy Way
Lexington Park MD
20653
United States

Jul 22, 2024
Invoice # 469

\$ 29494.46

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Ferko, G. (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Jun 14, 2021 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jul 7, 2021 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jul 7, 2021 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC): Jul 15, 2021 Michael Eisenberg	00:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC 2021): Review and reply to e-mail from PRT. Jul 16, 2021 Review and reply to e-mail from PRT. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC): Review e-mail from client, E-mail to government. Jul 16, 2021 Review e-mail from client, E-mail to government. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC 2021): Review RBA web portal, E-mail to government, Review docket filing; E-mail to client.. Jul 30, 2021 Review RBA web portal, E-mail to government, Review docket filing; E-mail to client.. Michael Eisenberg	00:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC - 2021): Review government e-mails. E-mail to JM.. Jul 30, 2021 Review government e-mails. E-mail to JM.. Michael Eisenberg	00:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC - 2021): Review government e-mails, Jul 30, 2021 Review government e-mails, Michael Eisenberg	00:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA - USCAVC - 2021): Review government e-mails. E-mail to JM.. Jul 30, 2021 Review government e-mails. E-mail to JM.. Michael Eisenberg	00:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA CAVC): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Aug 14, 2021 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:18	\$ 247.61	\$ 74.28
Ferko, G. (VA - CAVC - 2021) Oct 5, 2021 mediation. Michael Eisenberg	00:48	\$ 247.61	\$ 198.09
Telephone Call Oct 5, 2021 Mediation. Michael Eisenberg	00:54	\$ 247.61	\$ 222.85
Various Dec 19, 2021 Review file. E-mail to CDV. Michael Eisenberg	00:17	\$ 247.61	\$ 74.28
Various Jan 4, 2022 Review file. Michael Eisenberg	00:37	\$ 247.61	\$ 173.33

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Drafting Jan 11, 2022 Draft and Edit Brief. Michael Eisenberg	02:48	\$ 247.61	\$ 693.31
Drafting Jan 9, 2022 Draft brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:57	\$ 247.61	\$ 247.61
Drafting Jan 12, 2022 Finalize and File Brief. E-mail to CV. Michael Eisenberg	03:13	\$ 247.61	\$ 817.11
Drafting Apr 27, 2022 Drafting opening brief and reviewing record. Researched/checked cites on LEXIS for 45 minutes. Bryant Randall	06:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 600.00
Drafting May 12, 2022 Review brief. E-mail to ME. Michael Eisenberg	00:18	\$ 247.61	\$ 74.28
Drafting May 23, 2022 Review brief. E-mail to ME. Michael Eisenberg	00:10	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Drafting May 22, 2022 Reading gov brief and drafting reply brief. Bryant Randall	07:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 700.00
Lexis Nexis Research May 22, 2022 Lexis Nexis Research on gov cases for reply brief. Bryant Randall	00:45	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00
Drafting May 23, 2022 Reviewing comments and changes to Ferko reply brief and proofreading. Bryant Randall	00:40	\$ 100.00	\$ 70.00
Research May 25, 2022 Researching Groves v. McDonald, the documents the client sent, and the 2020 DBQ. Bryant Randall	03:50	\$ 100.00	\$ 390.00

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Research May 26, 2022 Searching medical records for a htn diagnosis in service. Bryant Randall	03:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 300.00
Drafting Jul 11, 2022 Review and file reply brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:42	\$ 247.61	\$ 173.33
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review and reply to e-mail from AN. Oct 15, 2021 Review and reply to e-mail from AN. Michael Eisenberg	00:01	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Oct 19, 2021 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review and reply to e-mail from CC. Dec 20, 2021 Review and reply to e-mail from CC. Michael Eisenberg	00:03	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA CAVC 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Jan 7, 2022 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:03	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jan 8, 2022 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G. (VA - USCAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Jan 18, 2022 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:11	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jan 22, 2022 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:04	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Jan 28, 2022 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:03	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Apr 7, 2022 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:02	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 21-3467): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. May 30, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. May 31, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:01	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. May 31, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:01	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC): Review and reply to e-mail from client. Jun 21, 2022 Review and reply to e-mail from client. Michael Eisenberg	00:03	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review and reply to e-mail from client. Jun 30, 2022 Review and reply to e-mail from client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jul 12, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:02	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jul 27, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 21-3467): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Aug 10, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:02	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Nov 7, 2022 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Telephone Call Jan 30, 2023 Telephone conversation with client. Michael Eisenberg	00:11	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Various - Draft Supplemental Brief. Feb 6, 2023 Draft Supplemental Brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:17	\$ 247.61	\$ 74.28
Review briefs Feb 11, 2023 Review Briefs Michael Eisenberg	00:19	\$ 247.61	\$ 99.04
Research Feb 15, 2023 Research for supplemental brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:29	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81
Research Feb 16, 2023 Research for brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:32	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Research Feb 17, 2023 Research for brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:35	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Research Feb 20, 2023 Research for brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:26	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81
Research Feb 24, 2023 Research for brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:21	\$ 247.61	\$ 99.04

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jan 13, 2023 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jan 26, 2023 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 21-3467): Review docket filings and calendar and task as appropriate; E-mail to client. Feb 2, 2023 Review docket filings and calendar and task as appropriate; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:28	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review and reply to e-mail from client. Feb 2, 2023 Review and reply to e-mail from client. Michael Eisenberg	00:02	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Mar 2, 2023 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Mar 2, 2023 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Drafting Mar 22, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:41	\$ 247.61	\$ 173.33
Drafting Mar 27, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:31	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Drafting Mar 28, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:30	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Drafting Mar 29, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:24	\$ 247.61	\$ 99.04
Drafting Mar 30, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:29	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81
Drafting Apr 1, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:36	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Drafting Apr 3, 2023 Drafting and filing Motions and Notice. Michael Eisenberg	01:44	\$ 247.61	\$ 445.70
Telephone Call Apr 7, 2023 Call to clerks office. Left voice message. Michael Eisenberg	00:03	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Drafting Apr 8, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:26	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81
Drafting Apr 10, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:31	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Drafting Apr 12, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	01:12	\$ 247.61	\$ 297.13
Drafting Apr 14, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:42	\$ 247.61	\$ 173.33
Drafting Apr 15, 2023 Drafting brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:54	\$ 247.61	\$ 222.85
Meeting w KW Apr 17, 2023 Case discussion and strategy.	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Michael Eisenberg			
Various Apr 17, 2023 Review, complete, and file Motion for Oral Arguments. E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:47	\$ 247.61	\$ 198.09
Drafting Apr 19, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	00:32	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Drafting Apr 21, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	00:58	\$ 247.61	\$ 247.61
Drafting Apr 24, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	00:28	\$ 247.61	\$ 123.81
Drafting Apr 27, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	01:27	\$ 247.61	\$ 371.42
Drafting Apr 29, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	03:17	\$ 247.61	\$ 817.11
Drafting May 1, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	03:26	\$ 247.61	\$ 866.64
Drafting May 2, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	03:11	\$ 247.61	\$ 792.35
Drafting May 3, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	04:39	\$ 247.61	\$ 1163.77
Drafting May 4, 2023 Drafting	08:23	\$ 247.61	\$ 2079.92

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Michael Eisenberg			
Drafting May 4, 2023 Drafting Michael Eisenberg	01:01	\$ 247.61	\$ 272.37
Drafting May 12, 2023 Correct and file brief. Michael Eisenberg	00:43	\$ 247.61	\$ 198.09
Various Jun 5, 2023 Prepare for Oral Arguments. Review cases. Michael Eisenberg	01:23	\$ 247.61	\$ 346.65
Various Jun 5, 2023 Review information about actually appearing in DC. Michael Eisenberg	00:10	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Various Jun 6, 2023 Prep for Hearing. Michael Eisenberg	01:37	\$ 247.61	\$ 420.94
Various Jun 10, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	00:58	\$ 247.61	\$ 247.61
Various Jun 11, 2023 Prep for Oral Arguments. Michael Eisenberg	00:57	\$ 247.61	\$ 247.61
Meeting with clerk. Jun 12, 2023 Prep for hearing. Alyssa Berry	00:08	\$ 100.00	\$ 20.00
Meeting w clerks. Jun 13, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	00:39	\$ 247.61	\$ 173.33
Various Jun 13, 2023 Prep for Oral Arguments	00:58	\$ 247.61	\$ 247.61

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Michael Eisenberg			
Meeting w KW Jun 13, 2023 Discuss and strategize oral arguments. Michael Eisenberg	00:31	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Prep for Oral arguments. Jun 14, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	01:55	\$ 247.61	\$ 495.22
Drafting Jun 14, 2023 Drafting Memo regarding if in VA/CAVC appeals an argument is not made in an opening brief it can be brought up later. Alyssa Berry	03:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 300.00
Drafting Jun 14, 2023 Research and drafting memo regarding whether tolling require a veteran to act immediately after the "extraordinary circumstance," Alyssa Berry	03:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 300.00
Prep for hearing. Jun 16, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	01:56	\$ 247.61	\$ 495.22
Various Jun 17, 2023 Prep for Oral Arguments. Michael Eisenberg	03:13	\$ 247.61	\$ 817.11
Various Jun 18, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	01:28	\$ 247.61	\$ 371.42
Various Jun 19, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	00:36	\$ 247.61	\$ 148.57
Various Jun 20, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	01:55	\$ 247.61	\$ 495.22

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Various Jun 21, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	04:29	\$ 247.61	\$ 1114.25
Meeting with clerks Jun 19, 2023 Prep for hearing. Alyssa Berry	00:14	\$ 100.00	\$ 30.00
Reviewing BVA Transcript Jun 20, 2023 Reviewing transcript for Va. Mail issue. Alyssa Berry	00:30	\$ 100.00	\$ 50.00
Drafting Jun 21, 2023 Memo re: AMA and Legacy Process for appeal to the Secretary. Research of processes. Alyssa Berry	04:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 400.00
Drafting Jun 21, 2023 Memo re: Substantive v. Jurisdictional Appeal and filing substantive appeals. Alyssa Berry	02:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00
Various Jun 22, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	00:44	\$ 247.61	\$ 198.09
Various Jun 22, 2023 Arrive at Court, meet Court Clerk in Library, Hearing. Michael Eisenberg	02:15	\$ 247.61	\$ 569.50
Various Jun 15, 2023 Attend Kernz Oral Arguments (as it relates to Ferkko). Michael Eisenberg	01:45	\$ 247.61	\$ 445.70
Various Jun 19, 2023 Prep for hearing. Michael Eisenberg	00:59	\$ 247.61	\$ 247.61
Review Jun 7, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	01:38	\$ 100.00	\$ 170.00

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Review Jun 8, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	01:42	\$ 100.00	\$ 170.00
Ferko reading Jun 12, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	00:11	\$ 100.00	\$ 20.00
Hearing Prep Jun 12, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	00:39	\$ 100.00	\$ 70.00
Review Jun 13, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	01:18	\$ 100.00	\$ 130.00
Brief review Jun 15, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	02:50	\$ 100.00	\$ 290.00
Hearing prep with MDJE Jun 14, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	00:57	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00
Brief review Jun 15, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	02:29	\$ 100.00	\$ 250.00
Research Jun 17, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	01:23	\$ 100.00	\$ 140.00
Research Jun 19, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	05:05	\$ 100.00	\$ 310.00
Team Meeting Ferko Jun 19, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	00:14	\$ 100.00	\$ 30.00
Review Jun 21, 2023 Research and prep for hearing.	02:07	\$ 100.00	\$ 220.00

Law Office of MDJE
700 12th Street NW
STE 700
Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Kevin Walsh			
Prep with MDJE Jun 20, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	01:07	\$ 100.00	\$ 120.00
Review and research for hearing. Jun 21, 2023 Review and research for hearing. Kevin Walsh	02:24	\$ 100.00	\$ 240.00
Research, Downloading Cases for Hearing Jun 21, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	01:05	\$ 100.00	\$ 110.00
Downloading Cases for Court Jun 21, 2023 Prep for hearing. Kevin Walsh	00:45	\$ 100.00	\$ 80.00
Hearing Jun 22, 2023 Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Kevin Walsh	02:05	\$ 100.00	\$ 210.00
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021)): Review and reply to e-mail from client. Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Apr 5, 2023 Review and reply to e-mail from client. Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:08	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Apr 13, 2023 Review docket filing(s); E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filings; E-mail to client. May 12, 2023 Review docket filings; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:08	\$ 247.61	\$ 49.52
Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jun 24, 2023 Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:06	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76

Law Office of MDJE
 700 12th Street NW
 STE 700
 Washington, DC 20005

Item	Hrs / Qty	Rate / Price	Subtotal
Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Jan 10, 2024 Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:05	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G Mar 28, 2024 Drafting Brief. Brian Tarno	02:29	\$ 100.00	\$ 250.00
Varios Mar 6, 2024 Ferko, G., (VA - CAVC - 2021): Review docket filing; E-mail to client. Michael Eisenberg	00:04	\$ 247.61	\$ 24.76
Ferko, G. Feb 22, 2024 Research and draft brief. Brian Tarno	08:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 800.00
Ferko, G Copy Copy Feb 8, 2024 Review of file and draft brief. Brian Tarno	03:00	\$ 100.00	\$ 300.00
Ferko, G Feb 1, 2024 Review file. work on brief. Brian Tarno	02:03	\$ 100.00	\$ 210.00

Thank you for your prompt payment!

Subtotal \$ 29494.46
Invoice Total \$ 29494.46